Lower Bucks (County Yoint Manicipal Authority

CONTRACT NO. C-304: FURNISH AND SUPPLY CHEMICALS FOR LOWER BUCKS COUNTY JOINT MUNICIPAL AUTHORITY’S
WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANTS, LEVITTOWN, BUCKS COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA
TABULATION OF BIDS

Bid tabulations will be G 5. C
presented to the Authority’s Greer Lime Co | JCI Jones Chemical Inc. Norit America Carmeuse N. America eO(r:%zm.icatl)yne Standard Purification Univar USA, Inc.
ne';"(‘t’zﬂ 33.323333 ::nt::t'irng 598 Canyon Road 103 River Street 3200 Universiry Ave | 11 Stanwix St-11 Fir 3015 State Road 88 Fairview W 532 E. Emaus Street
on February 25, 2010. Morgantown, WV Warwick, NY 10990 Marshall, TX 75671 Pittsburgh, PA Croydon, PA 19021 Tequesta, FL 33469 Middletown, PA 17057
NI UNIT PRICE NIT UNIT PRICE NI UNIT PRICE NI UNIT PRICE NIT UNIT PRICE
ITEM UNIT PRICE PER PER PER PER PER PER
PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PER GALLON PRICE PRICE PRICE
NO. CHEMICAL NAME GALLON OR POUND GALLON OR GALLON OR GALLON OR GALLON OR GALLON OR
PER CWT PER CWT OR POUND DELIVERED PER CWT PER CWT PER CWT
DELIVERED POUND POUND POUND POUND POUND
DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED
DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED DELIVERED
CHLORINE — TON
1. CONTAINER NO BID $22.85 $0.2285 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.80 $0.318
SODIUM POTASSIUM
2. ZINC POLYPHOSPHATE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $122.92 $1.2292 NO BID NO BID
204659 $0.458
3. FLUOROSILICIC ACID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $46.59 elnglti/— NO BID $45.80 Density=
) 10 Ibs/gal
Ibs/gal
POTASSIUM
4, PERMANGANATE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $239.98 $2.3998 NO BID $315.40 $3.154
LIME SLURRY TREATMENT $1.9988
CHEMICAL-CALGON BLR- Density=
5. 3715 OR CES LIME-D- NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $199.88 8.43 NO BID NO BID
SCALE Ibs/gal
6. (P:gngDOEI\TED ACTIVATED NO BID NO BID $74.00 $0.74 NO BID NO BID $63.40 $0.634 NO BID
7. HYDRATED LIME $0.092/1b NO BID NO BID $0.082475 NO BID NO BID NO BID
8. ngSR;ATED LIME (50LB $0.13/Ib NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




