

Lower Bucks County Joint Municipal Authority

**CONTRACT NO. WTP-414: FURNISH AND SUPPLY CHEMICALS FOR LOWER BUCKS COUNTY JOINT MUNICIPAL AUTHORITY'S
WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANTS, LEVITTOWN, BUCKS COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA
BID DATE: JUNE 23, 2020**

| ITEM NO. | CHEMICAL NAME | Greer Industries PO Box 1900 Morgantown, WV 26507 | | Carmeuse Lime 11 Stanwix St, 21 st floor Pittsburgh, PA 15222 | | Shannon Chemical Corp 311 Commerce Drive Exton, PA 19341 | | George S. Coyne Chemical 3015 State Road Croydon, PA 19021 | | Univar USA, Inc. 532 E. Emaus Street Middletown, PA 17057 | |
|----------|------------------------------|---|--|--|--|--|---|--|---|---|--|
| | | UNIT PRICE PER CWT DELIVERED | UNIT PRICE PER GALLON OR POUND DELIVERED | UNIT PRICE PER CWT DELIVERED | UNIT PRICE PER GALLON OR POUND DELIVERED | UNIT PRICE PER CWT DELIVERED | UNIT PRICE PER GALLON OR POUND DELIVERED | UNIT PRICE PER CWT DELIVERED | UNIT PRICE PER GALLON OR POUND DELIVERED | UNIT PRICE PER CWT DELIVERED | UNIT PRICE PER GALLON OR POUND DELIVERED |
| 1. | ZINC POLYPHOSPHATE | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 104.44 | \$ 1.0444 / lb | \$ 124.6774 | \$ 1.2468 / lb | NO BID | NO BID |
| 2. | FLUROSILICIC ACID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 30.64 | \$ <u>3.064</u> /gal \$ <u>0.3064 lb</u> Density= 10.0 lbs/gal | \$32.8776 | \$ <u>3.3108</u> /gal \$ <u>0.3288 lb</u> Density= 10.07 lbs/gal | \$ 29.50 | \$ <u>2.95</u> /gal \$ <u>0.295 lb</u> Density= 10.0 lbs/gal |
| 3. | HYDRATED LIME | \$ 10.85 | \$ 0.1085 / lb | \$ 12.758 | \$ 0.12758 / lb | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 13.20 | \$ 0.132 / lb |
| 4. | HYDRATED LIME (50LB BAGS) | \$ 15.50 | \$ 0.155 / lb | \$ 15.758 | \$ 0.15758 / lb | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | \$ 19.50 | \$ 0.195 / lb |

The bids were presented to the Board of Directors at their last meeting and awarded to the lowest bidders contingent upon receiving all required documents.